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PRIVACY POLICY 

1. INTRODUCTION 

IFH Capital Trader Ltd, an Investment Firm headquartered in Sliema, Malta, is authorized and 
regulated by the Malta Financial Services Authority (www.mfsa.mt) under license code GMCP 
(hereinafter referred to as the “Company,” “we,” “our,” or “us”). We are committed to safeguarding 
any personal data we receive and collect from you, ensuring protection against misuse, loss, or 
unauthorized access, in accordance with applicable data protection laws. 

2. INFORMATION COLLECTED 

This Privacy Policy pertains to the personal data collected by the Company from any individual or entity 
contacting us through our Website. As a Visitor, we collect web page download information and site 
usage data. As an Applicant, we reserve the right to collect information gathered from Visitors, along 
with any confidential information you voluntarily provide, and any additional data requested. 

We respect Visitors' privacy and only collect personal information voluntarily provided. This may 
include, among other things, your name, email address, phone number, IP address, and company 
information. We also maintain usage data derived from your interactions with our Website. 

We are committed to preventing unauthorized access to your details and do not disclose any collected 
information to third parties, except as required by law or regulation. 

3. PURPOSE OF COLLECTION AND PROCESSING 

We collect only necessary personal data from Visitors and Applicants to fulfill specific purposes, 
restricting data processing to those purposes alone. 

4. HOW LONG WE KEEP YOUR PERSONAL DATA 

We retain personal information for as long as necessary for legal or business purposes, adhering to 
applicable laws, contractual obligations, and Applicant expectations. Upon expiry of data retention 
periods, we securely destroy the information. 

5. RIGHTS 

Under data protection laws, you have various rights regarding your personal data: 

• Right to access your personal data 

• Right to correct inaccuracies in your personal data 

• Right to erasure of your personal data 

• Right to object to processing of your personal data 

• Right to request restriction of processing 

• Right to data portability 

• Right to withdraw consent at any time 
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6. COOKIES 

Our Website uses cookies to enhance user experience. You can manage cookies directly through your 
internet browser settings. By accepting our Privacy Policy, you consent to data processing and 
collection as outlined herein. 

7. MODIFICATIONS TO THIS PRIVACY POLICY 

The Company reserves the right to modify this Privacy Policy at its discretion. Please refer to our 
Website regularly for updates. 

8. ACCEPTANCE OF THESE TERMS 

By using our Website, you consent to the processing of your data and agree to the terms outlined in 
this Privacy Policy. You waive rights to hold the Company liable for claims arising from data processing, 
except in cases of fraudulent or negligent processing. 

9. HOW TO CONTACT US 

For inquiries regarding this Privacy Policy, your personal data, or our services, contact our designated 
Data Protection Officer via email, phone, or mail as provided below: 

Contact Information: IFH Capital Trader Ltd 228, Tower Road Sliema SLM 1601 Malta Email: 
dpo@icapitaltrader.com Phone: +356 276 21611 
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